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effectiveness of the school’s SHS in
managing physician care and refer-
rals to specialists and
sub-specialists, the distribution of a
student health insurance claim
dollar is lower than employer-spon-
sored plans in the
categories of inpatient
care and physician
services, but higher
in the more infla-
tion prone
categories of
outpatient
and prescrip-
tion drugs.

Because
of variations
in plan
designs
school by
school, it is
not possible
to general-
ize with
any specificity, but it is safe to say
that in student plans, inpatient
care, as a proportion of the health
insurance claim dollar, is often close
to one half of what it would be in an
employed population. (A high
degree of the variability in inpa-
tient care in student plans is
maternity admissions, which are
less predictable in student popula-
tions because of the relatively low
number of dependents covered
under the plan.)

While the student population has
relatively greater exposure to the
higher trend components of health
care, the impact is somewhat offset
by its better morbidity profile rela-
tive to the employed population.
Medical conditions for students
tend to be more acute than chronic
and are often of a lower severity
level. Because of their relative
young age, students are simply not
exposed to certain medical condi-
tions (e.g. multiple organ system
disease) that require invasive,
expensive medical treatment.

Putting this all together, the
projected trend for student plans
for the 2002 – 2003 school year is
anticipated to be comparable to
employer-sponsored plans in the
same geographic area unless plan

design features are already in place
to control prescription drug costs
and outpatient care. Without these
kinds of limits, trend for many
schools is likely to be in the mid-
teens.

What can be done to moderate
trend for future years? Employer-

sponsored plans
are taking four
approaches:
first, substan-
tially greater

cost-shifting to
employees
through
increased premi-
ums, deductibles,
copayments and

benefit caps,
particularly on
prescription
drugs. Second,
more selective
physician

networks, particularly specialists.
Third, enhanced disease and
demand management through
nurse “800” phone systems,
computer information systems and
one-to-one case management.
Finally, some are considering bold
plan redesigns where the first
$1000 to $2000 in expenses is the
employee’s responsibility through

funded medical spending accounts
(MSA’s).

Unfortunately, most of these
strategies have little applicability to
student plans. The student, or more

likely, their parents, already pay
100% of the premium. Schools’ SHS
currently are quite disciplined
about specialist referrals. There is
relatively little serious or chronic
morbidity for assignment to case
management. And, it is an open
question as to whether the medical
spending account model would be
an appropriate choice for students,
many of whom are just learning
how to manage their own finances.

What, then, is left? Three oppor-
tunities should be considered. First,
schools should revisit all aspects of
plan design to ensure that appropri-
ate cost sharing and plan limits are
in place. We do not recommend
those benefit caps which would
leave the truly ill and injured
exposed, but we do suggest, for
example, a prescription drug
program with strong incentives to
use generics.

Second, Student Health Services
should consider bringing some
specialty and subspecialty care into
the Student Health Service on a
salaried or “sessions” basis and nego-
tiate with their insurers to pay for
this through capitation, or direct
cost reimbursement. Third, Student
Health Services might consider more
careful oversight over outpatient
care, particularly outpatient surgery.

Conclusion
Trend in health costs and insurance
premiums is likely to continue to be
in double digits for the next three to
four years. This is a national issue
and one that will be difficult for an
individual program to moderate
substantially. Despite that, ration-
alizing the delivery system, having
plan designs which encourage
appropriate utilization and continu-
ing to enhance the role of the SHS
as the care manager will make
sense even if the results are only
measured in a percentage point or
two.

Paul A. Cronin, FSA, MAAA, EA,
is senior vice president at The
Chickering Group in Boston, MA.
He can be reached at pcronin@
chickering.com.

‘Because of their
relative young age,
students are simply
not exposed to
certain medical
conditions that
require invasive,
expensive medical
treatment.’



After witnessing strong sales
of similar products in Japan
and the United Kingdom, a

number of U.S. insurers have
recently jumped aboard the “critical
illness” insurance express and are
developing this product for sale in
the United States. While the critical
illness (CI) insurance concept is not
new to the U.S., the current prod-
ucts being sold introduce new
wrinkles that pose interesting
issues for insurers in pric-
ing, underwriting
and marketing. As
can be expected,
insurers thus
far have strug-
gled to find the
right balance of
the three P’s
(product design,
positioning and
price) to
address these
wrinkles, but
now with the
kinks worked
out, market indica-
tions suggest that
critical illness insurance is
ready to take off in the United
States. What is critical illness
insurance and why is now the time
for insurers to enter the CI market-
place?

Product Design
In the simplest terms, critical illness
insurance pays benefits when the
insured person becomes ill with one
or more specified conditions. This
concept is not new to the U.S.
market. For many years, direct and
affinity marketers have sold indem-
nity hospital benefit policies for
cancer, heart attack and/or heart
disease, stroke and other conditions.
Some insurers even offered products
or riders that paid relatively modest
(up to $5,000 or $10,000) lump sum
benefits upon diagnosis of serious
cancer, coma or paralysis. The stand-
alone policies of this type went by

several names, including “dread
disease” insurance, “cancer” insur-
ance and “limited benefit” insurance.
While they are still commonly sold
today in the direct marketing arena,
these policies have not typically been
viewed favorably by regulators and
have not sold well in more tradi-
tional insurance sales distribution
channels.

Most of the stand-alone critical
illness products being designed for

sale in the USA today are
similar to the

stand-alone CI
products being
marketed
heavily in
Great Britain

and Japan. These
policies are funded

by level premi-
ums from
issue age
(or age
band) and

pay out
a
substan-

tial lump
sum benefit of

$10,000 to $50,000 upon diagnosis
of one or more critical diseases or
conditions. They may also offer
riders that reimburse insureds for
certain extraordinary medical
expenses incurred for treatment of
these conditions. In addition, a
number of insurers are also now
offering critical illness riders for
sale with annuity and life insurance
policies. There are even critical
illness riders being added to other
health insurance products, includ-
ing disability and accidental death
and dismemberment insurance. The
list of disorders covered under a
critical illness policy or rider varies
by insurer, but following are some of
the more commonly covered condi-
tions:
• Cancer, other than skin cancer 
• Heart attack and/or 

heart surgery

• Multiple sclerosis
• Stroke
• Paralysis
• Major organ transplant
• Renal failure
• Coma
• Loss of limb(s)
• Blindness
• Alzheimer’s disease
• “Terminal” illness

The conditions covered and the
benefits payable for each covered
condition have significant ramifica-
tions for the product’s marketing
strategy/positioning, target buyer
profile and of course, pricing. For
example, an insurer offering a
$50,000 lump sum critical illness
benefit upon diagnosis of
Alzheimer’s disease, multiple scle-
rosis, stroke and paralysis may
have unintentionally created a
high-end supplemental insurance
product that competes with Long-
Term Care (LTC) insurance. On the
other hand, an insurer offering a
$10,000 lump sum benefit upon
diagnosis of cancer should expect
its product to compete with the
mass marketers for the lower-end
consumer buyers. A CI rider to a life
insurance policy that advances a
portion of the death benefit upon
diagnosis of “terminal illness” is not
anything new to the market; these
accelerated benefit riders have been
available for years. However, a CI
rider to a life insurance policy that
advances a portion of the death
benefit upon a paralyzing accident
is a new twist on an old concept and
may be viewed favorably in the
market.

Another important aspect of CI
policy or rider product design is
whether to include a survival wait-
ing period requirement after a
critical illness diagnosis has been
made. In order to prevent
consumers from viewing a CI policy
as a life insurance policy, some
carriers require that the insured
must survive at least 14 – 30 days
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after diagnosis of the covered criti-
cal illness to be eligible for benefit
payment. If the individual dies
before the 14 – 30 day waiting
period, no benefit is paid. Such a
requirement reinforces the premise
that critical illness insurance is
designed to cover the plethora of
expenses associated with diagnosis
of a serious illness not covered by
other insurance products, and is not
a substitute for, among others, life
insurance (see positioning). This
requirement also reduces the
policy’s cost. On the other hand, the
carrier risks serious dissatisfaction
and perhaps even a lawsuit if a
policyholder dies from complica-
tions of a covered critical illness
during the waiting period. The
carriers who do not require a
survival waiting period generally
cite legal, regulatory and policy-
holder / beneficiary dissatisfaction
concerns as their reasons for their
decision.

Another product design consider-
ation for stand-alone CI products is
how much up-front medical under-
writing will be performed, and how
to limit adverse selection risk
through product design specifica-
tions. Until now, most carriers have
designed their stand-alone CI prod-
ucts for sale in markets that do not
view long-form medical underwrit-
ing favorably (small employer
work-site marketing, direct and
affinity marketing, true large group
marketing), so the products utilize
a simplified underwriting screen.
This is, of course, dangerous since
many critical illnesses are heredi-
tary in nature and applicant
adverse selection can present a seri-
ous problem. Using such a
simplified underwriting approach
means that claims risk must also be
controlled through product design
limitations and marketing
approach. The most common prod-
uct design limitations in use are
pre-existing exclusion clauses,
graded benefit provisions and
attained age benefit limitations.
When a pre-existing condition
exclusion is included in the policy,
benefits are not payable for critical
illness claims incurred within the

first two policy years that resulted
from conditions which existed
before the policy was issued. A
graded benefit provision limits the
benefits payable for covered critical
illnesses diagnosed or treated
within the first two years of policy
issuance to only a small amount,
such as two times the premiums
paid-to-date. An attained age bene-
fit limitation reduces the amount of
benefit that will be paid (typically
50% of face amount) when a critical

illness diagnosis is made after the
insured has reached a certain age
(typically 70 or 75). The pre-existing
condition clause and graded benefit
provisions are designed to reduce
up-front insured adverse selection
while the attained age benefit limi-
tation is designed primarily to
reduce ultimate claims exposure,
and thus premiums, to more
marketable and manageable levels.

As a means to reduce up-front
insured adverse selection, both the
pre-existing condition clause and
the graded benefit provision can be
effective, but not without down-
sides. Pre-existing condition clauses
are difficult to administer, particu-
larly in determining the scope and
definition of a pre-existing condi-
tion, and often result in
policyholder dissatisfaction and
perhaps litigation when a claim is
denied. On the other hand, graded
benefit provisions can essentially

eliminate all critical illness claims
in the first two policy years, even
ones that are clearly not related to
any pre-existing condition (such as
when an automobile accident leaves
an insured paralyzed). Many insur-
ers would prefer to use more
comprehensive up-front medical
underwriting to combat adverse
selection, but thus far, the market
has not moved this way. Including
attained age benefit reduction
provisions in the policy will keep
premiums lower, and should appeal
to the typical middle market insur-
ance buyer attempting to provide
for a family. Such provisions also fit
neatly into positioning CI for sale in
the work-site, where the focus is on
insuring against contingencies that
impact the working, as opposed to
retired, population. However, these
provisions also make the policy less
appealing to individuals in their
later working years (50+) and can
lead to serious dissatisfaction from
claimants who develop a critical
illness in their sunset years.

A significant advantage of selling
a CI rider rather than a stand-alone
CI policy is that the medical under-
writing process used for the base
policy may be used for the CI rider,
perhaps without significant modifi-
cation (obviously depending on the
type of base policy being sold and
the covered conditions of the CI
rider). When long-form medical
underwriting is used, pre-existing
condition exclusions and graded
benefit provisions may not be
needed for risk control purposes
and the rider may be viewed more
positively in the marketplace and
by regulators.

Positioning
Since critical illness insurance has
enjoyed strong sales in the tradi-
tional middle-class insurance
markets of Japan and the United
Kingdom, many U.S. insurers have
focused their recent critical illness
product design efforts on this
market as well. If this is the market
that U.S. insurers intend to pursue,
they must be very clear in their

(continued on page 14)

‘Using such a
simplified under-
writing approach
means that claims
risk must also be
controlled
through product
design limitations
and marketing
approach.’
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marketing materials as to why criti-
cal illness insurance makes sense for
an individual to purchase in light of
other insurance the individual may
already have. As demonstrated by
somewhat disappointing sales
results to date, this is where most
insurers have fallen short. They
have not effectively communicated
the need for, and utility of, the CI
product to the U.S. consumer insur-
ance buying population.

It must be very clear that critical
illness insurance is not a substitute
for, but rather is a supplement to,
major medical insurance, life insur-
ance, disability insurance and LTC
insurance (although there are
arguably instances where critical
illness insurance may be a substi-
tute for LTC insurance). This may
be an awkward message for some
insurers to relate to consumers
since they may have little experi-
ence touting the benefits of
“supplemental” coverage as opposed
to “primary” coverage. Similar to
the marketing of Group LTC insur-
ance, given the newness of the
critical illness insurance concept to
most Americans, a significant
amount of the marketing effort
must actually focus on educating
consumers on the utility and flexi-
bility of CI coverage. The education
process needs to focus on all the
miscellaneous hidden costs associ-
ated with the serious illness of a
family member and how useful a
large lump sum payment can be to
tide the family over until the infirm
person recovers.

In marketing critical illness as a
supplemental benefit, some key
messages need to be made. As a
supplement to major medical insur-
ance, critical illness coverage can
pay the cost of deductibles, co-
payments/co-insurance, prescription
drugs, experimental,
custodial/convalescent or non-tradi-
tional treatment options not
typically covered by the medical
plan. The CI benefit might enable
an insured in an HMO to receive

necessary care completely out-of-
network.

Comprehensive LTC policies do
cover the cost of custodial care
mentioned above, as long as the ill
individual meets certain benefit
eligibility criteria related to func-
tional and/or cognitive capacity. So,
in certain instances, a CI policy
might be considered a substitute for
LTC insurance rather than a
supplement to it. This should be
helpful to insurers who do not offer
LTC insurance currently, as they
can position CI as a lower cost,
more readily understandable
substitute for it. For insurers who
do offer LTC today, there may be
some advantage to cross-selling CI
to the younger LTC insureds,
assuming the CI policy does not

contain an attained age benefit
reduction provision, since the LTC
buyers have already shown a
commitment to buying supplemen-
tary insurance and are probably
financially suitable for the cover-
age. LTC insurers may suffer
cannibalization, however, if the LTC
insureds lapse in order to buy CI
rather than keeping both policies
in-force. Another option for LTC
writers to consider may be to
develop a combination CI/LTC prod-
uct for sale in the middle market.

As a supplement to disability
insurance, critical illness insurance
provides additional family income
needed because the infirm person
only collects a portion (usually 50%
or 60%) of his or her salary while on
long-term disability. In addition, CI
supplements the family’s dimin-
ished income resulting when a
healthy family member(s) needs to
either take extended leave from
work to care for the infirm person,
or needs to hire someone else to
provide this care so he/she can go to
work.

CI benefits can also be used to
defray the additional child-care
costs incurred when healthy adult
family members visit the ill family
member in a hospital, rehabilitation
center or nursing facility. CI bene-
fits may be used to pay the travel
and hotel accommodation costs
incurred when relatives come to
town on short notice to visit with a
sick relative or when infirm individ-
uals and their family members
travel out-of-town to receive
medical treatment. Finally, the CI
benefit can serve as a supplement
to life insurance if the claimant dies
before his lump sum benefit has
been exhausted paying for any of
the other above-mentioned costs.
When framed this way, it is easy to
see how a family could easily incur
$20,000 or more in illness related
expenses, not covered by primary
insurance, due to a serious illness
befalling a close family member.

Until now, the most successful
marketing of stand-alone CI insur-
ance has taken place in the small
employer work-site arena. This is
understandable when you consider
that the work-site marketing chan-
nel appears to have all the
ingredients necessary for the CI
insurance sale. First, the on-site
insurance agent or benefits special-
ist probably can gain a basic
understanding of the overall bene-
fits package offered by the
employer, and can speak to, and
thus market CI to cover the gaps in
these other coverages. In addition,
the all-important marketing educa-
tion process that is needed can be
accomplished through face-to-face

All Aboard the Critical Illness..
continued from page 13

‘It must be very
clear that critical
illness insurance
is not a substitute
for, but rather is a
supplement to,
major medical
insurance, life
insurance, disabil-
ity insurance and
LTC insurance...’
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contact with the on-site insurance
agent and/or human resource bene-
fits specialist. Finally, an on-site
agent should be able to efficiently
determine an employee’s financial
suitability for CI insurance, and
thus direct the CI sales process
effectively. In contrast, standard
group and direct marketing chan-
nels offer neither the personalized
sales approach nor the product
education effort needed to success-
fully market the merits of CI
insurance. These channels will
become more viable when
consumers become more aware of
the benefits of and need for CI
insurance. Traditional individual
agent marketing should also
become more prevalent and success-
ful when consumer awareness is
heightened, although the availabil-
ity of high commissions from
insurers who want to remain in the
individual health insurance market
place with a product that is less
subject to the adverse selection of
individual disability income insur-
ance and the trend costs of major
medical insurance could speed
along the process.

Positioning of CI riders is less
problematic than positioning CI
policies. By definition, riders are
supplementary to the base policy
being sold, so the insurer doesn’t
need to apologize for the supple-
mentary nature of the CI coverage.
CI riders, particularly ones
covering coma and
paralysis, are growing
in popularity in the
life insurance
market, where
marketing of
other riders such
as waiver of
premium, AD&D
and terminal
illness accelerated
benefit has been
accomplished
successfully for
years. In addition, more and more
annuity writers are including a
lump sum Alzheimer’s disease bene-
fit rider on retirement annuities to
compete with LTC insurance. Also,
disability carriers have recently

started offering CI (and LTC) riders
on their individual disability
income policies, where the covered
conditions range from coma and
paralysis to stroke and heart
disease. Thus far, most insurers
have developed CI riders to
help distinguish their prod-
uct offerings from
those of their
competitors and
showcase their
product develop-
ment innovations
while touting the
flexibility and utility
of the CI benefit rider to the
consumer. As CI riders become more
commonplace in the market, they
will obviously no longer be consid-
ered innovative, so insurers will
need to adjust their positioning to
focus primarily on the flexibility
and value of the CI benefit to the
consumer.

Price
As with any new product, pricing is
a challenge. As mentioned earlier,
most of the newer stand-alone CI
products are being funded with
level premiums from issue age (or
age band). Thus, to establish
premium rates, the pricing actuary
must project product line income,
benefits and expenses over a fairly
long period of time, such as 20 or 30
years. Assumptions must be made

as to morbidity, mortality,
voluntary lapse, invest-
ment earnings and
product line expenses.

Morbidity assump-
tions are clearly a
challenge. Where can
the pricing actuary

obtain reliable,
credible critical
illness incidence

data? Since CI poli-
cies and riders pay

large benefits upon very
low incidence rate events, such as

organ transplants, it could take 10
years or more for even insured
claims experience data to be consid-
ered credible. Even insurers who
have access to substantial amounts
of major medical claims experience

are not necessarily at an advantage
over carriers who do not offer
health coverage since the incidence

rate data for covered
critical illnesses
may not be readily
available, or credi-
ble even if
available. Health

insurers must
not only have
incurred a
substantial
number of CI
claims, they

must also have
good exposure data

to determine their experienced inci-
dence rates for these claims. Since
the claims themselves are rare, and
the exposure data may not be
collected or validated if collected, it
is quite possible that the insurer’s
medical claims experience, while
voluminous, may be inappropriate
or useless for CI product or rider
pricing. Pricing actuaries will prob-
ably need to turn to government
population data and statistics
(which, in turn, needs to be
adjusted to an insured environ-
ment) to develop a baseline
morbidity scale, and validate it
against the pricing data ware-
houses of major consulting firms
and re-insurers to gain a stronger
measure of confidence in their pric-
ing morbidity projections.

In addition, pricing actuaries will
need to adjust durational morbidity
for the impact of medical under-
writing (long-form or short-form),
the product’s limitations and exclu-
sions, applicant adverse selection,
and the marketing distribution
method. As discussed earlier, since
most stand-alone CI products
utilize a simplified underwriting
screen, the potential for applicant
adverse selection based on adverse
family medical history is substan-
tial. On the other hand, the use of
simplified underwriting in conjunc-
tion with product design limitations
and exclusions and possibly re-
insurance, should enable the
insurer to manage the stand-alone

(continued on page 16)
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CI product risk to acceptable levels.
Applicant adverse selection is more
of a concern in some distribution
channels than others, and the pric-
ing actuary must consider this in
pricing the CI product.

Claims experience on CI products
sold through the small or large
employer work-site should develop
at least as favorably, if not more
favorably, than claims experience on
these products sold through direct
response methods or career agent
channels, since marketing efforts
can be limited to actively-at-work,
full time employees during stan-
dard benefit enrollment periods for
new hires and existing employees.
Selling a CI policy on the Internet,
for example, using simplified under-
writing is more risky than selling
the same policy in the workplace
since actively-at-work employees,
by virtue of their working status,
demonstrate a measure of good
health that is not known for the on-
line applicant at the time of
application. The effect of insurance
agent adverse selection must also
be considered, including that of on-
site sales representatives at small
employers. The impact of applicant
and distribution channel adverse
selection is significantly mitigated
on CI riders so CI riders are consid-
ered less risky than stand-alone CI
products.

CI, like LTC insurance, is a prod-
uct that builds large reserves for
future claims, especially if attained
age benefit reductions are
not included in
the policy. When
sold in primarily
variable cost
distribution
channels (such as
career agent distri-
bution channels where commissions
are the primary marketing
expense), low lapse and mortality
rates in later durations can have an
unfavorable impact on financial
results. Most insurers currently
assume that CI product lapse and

mortality will emerge in
a manner consistent
with their other health or
life insurance product
offerings. When LTC
insurance was first sold,
many companies made a
similar assumption—that
LTC lapse rates
would be similar to
individual major
medical or life
insurance lapse
rates—and were unpleasantly
surprised to find that LTC lapse
rates were much lower than they
expected, which in turn led to
concerns about the adequacy of
their LTC insurance premium rates.
If CI is to avoid the same pitfall, CI
pricing actuaries need to carefully
test the impact of both high and low
lapse and mortality decrement
rates on their ultimate premium
rate levels. Specific margin for
adverse experience is desirable.

An advantage of selling in fixed
cost distribution channels, such as
direct or employer group market-
ing, is that the concerns about the
impact of low decrement rates on
profitability are less applicable, or
applicable only within certain
threshold tolerances. This is
because the present value of
marketing costs as a percent of the
present value of premium may
decrease more than the lifetime
loss ratio increases when decre-
ment rates decrease. For example,
for direct-marketed CI, if the early
duration lapse rates decrease from
the 30% to 40% range to the 20%
to 30% range, overall returns will
increase dramatically. Similarly, if
the product experiences 5% or

10% level lapse rates,
returns would also be

much higher, but the
level 5% lapse rate

financials may not be as
favorable as the level 10%

lapse financials. This is because
the increase in the lifetime loss
ratio resulting when lapses
decrease beyond a certain point
(say from 10% to 5%) outweighs
the benefit of the further reduction
in marketing cost.

A related issue to product
line persistency is the
assumed excess earnings rate

on reserves. The higher the
reserves get, the more
dramatic an effect this
assumption has on profitabil-

ity. One percentage point
change in the overall

earnings rate (i.e.
from 6% to 7%) can

change lifetime GAAP
ROE or Statutory ROI by

1% to 5% depending on the persis-
tency of the business and the
morbidity margins built into the
reserves. The pricing actuary may
want to test the impact of various
combinations of interest earnings
rates and product persistency
assumptions on profitability before
settling on final assumptions for
either.

Finally, pricing expense factors
must be developed for the line. CI
insurance is not a particularly
labor intensive product to admin-
ister, so estimating policy
maintenance expenses should be
fairly straightforward for the pric-
ing actuary. Claims adjudication
expenses as a percent of claims
should be low since the CI benefit
is a large, single payment. Some
minor adjustments may need to be
made in the insurer’s administra-
tive system to handle CI, but these
modifications will probably not be
extensive. Perhaps the most signif-
icant additional expenses an
insurer will incur to develop,
market and administer CI will be
in the area of compliance. As
mentioned earlier, regulators
viewed some of the early genera-
tion CI-type policies unfavorably
due to the limited benefits and
poor overall consumer value
proposition they offered. Because
of this past experience, insurers
may need to put a bit more effort
into the CI policy form and rate-
filing approval process than they
are used to for other products.
Insurers should also expect to
encounter state variations in
terms of permissible coverage
features (for example, some states
do not allow cancer coverage) and

All Aboard the Critical Illness..
continued from page 15


